
ITEM 1: T-Shirts, Screen Printed
Shirt 5.3 oz 12   3.00 36.00$        2.90      34.80$        2.40    28.80$            1.99     23.88$        3.37    40.44$         3.28        39.36$        4.25      51.00$            
Color 12   0.85 10.20$        1.10      13.20$        0.60    7.20$              0.49     5.88$          0.80    9.60$           0.78        9.36$          0.85      10.20$            
L/S 12   -0.40 (4.80)$         2.20      26.40$        1.75    21.00$            1.65     19.80$        2.34    28.08$         3.48        41.76$        2.75      33.00$            
Pocket 12   1.70 20.40$        2.00      24.00$        1.20    14.40$            1.88     22.56$        1.20    14.40$         3.08        36.96$        2.00      24.00$            
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        24.00  24.00$            60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         30.00      30.00$        -        -$                
First Color 12   0.50 6.00$          1.00      12.00$        1.75    21.00$            25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         2.28        27.36$        2.50      30.00$            
Second Color 12   0.50 6.00$          0.25      3.00$          0.75    9.00$              25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         0.96        11.52$        1.00      12.00$            
First Color 12   0.50 6.00$          1.00      12.00$        1.75    21.00$            25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         2.28        27.36$        2.50      30.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 79.80$        140.40$      146.40$          1,032.12$   138.52$       223.68$      190.20$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 6.65$          11.70$        12.20$            86.01$        11.54$         18.64$        15.85$            

Shirt 6.1 oz 38   3.25 123.50$      3.15      119.70$      2.50    95.00$            2.64     100.32$      2.62    99.56$         2.65        100.70$      4.15      157.70$          
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        -      -$                60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         40.00      40.00$        -        -$                
First Color 38   0.50 19.00$        1.00      38.00$        1.10    41.80$            25.00   950.00$      0.75    28.50$         1.98        75.24$        2.00      76.00$            
Second Color 38   0.50 19.00$        0.25      9.50$          0.50    19.00$            25.00   950.00$      0.70    26.60$         0.71        26.98$        0.75      28.50$            
Third Color 38   0.50 19.00$        0.25      9.50$          0.50    19.00$            25.00   950.00$      0.75    28.50$         0.71        26.98$        0.75      28.50$            
First Color 38   0.50 19.00$        1.00      38.00$        1.10    41.80$            25.00   950.00$      0.75    28.50$         1.98        75.24$        2.00      76.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 199.50$      229.70$      216.60$          3,960.32$   221.66$       345.14$      366.70$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 5.25$          6.04$          5.70$              104.22$      5.83$           9.08$          9.65$              

Shirt 5.3 oz 224 2.30 515.20$      2.90      649.60$      2.35    526.40$          1.64     367.36$      2.37    530.88$       2.13        477.12$      3.15      705.60$          
Color 224 0.85 190.40$      1.10      246.40$      0.60    134.40$          0.49     109.76$      0.80    179.20$       0.78        174.72$      0.85      190.40$          
XX & XXX 10   1.25 12.50$        1.50      15.00$        1.50    15.00$            2.20     22.00$        2.00    20.00$         1.90        19.00$        1.80      18.00$            
Youth 200 0.25 50.00$        -        -$            0.25    50.00$            (0.35)   (70.00)$       0.25    50.00$         0.50        100.00$      0.40      80.00$            
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        -      -$                60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         20.00      20.00$        -        -$                
First Color 224 0.50 112.00$      1.00      224.00$      1.00    224.00$          25.00   5,600.00$   0.69    154.56$       1.47        329.28$      1.75      392.00$          
First Color 224 0.50 112.00$      1.00      224.00$      1.00    224.00$          25.00   5,600.00$   0.69    154.56$       1.47        329.28$      1.75      392.00$          
ORDER TOTAL 992.10$      1,374.00$   1,173.80$       11,689.12$ 1,099.20$    1,449.40$   1,778.00$       
AVG COST/SHIRT 4.43$          6.13$          5.24$              52.18$        4.91$           6.47$          7.94$              

1,090.90$   1,552.40$   1,362.00$       13,671.24$ 1,266.22$    1,748.32$   2,044.20$       

ITEM 2: Sweatshirts
Sweatshirt 9.3 oz 12   9.49 113.88$      11.30    135.60$      9.40    112.80$          21.00   252.00$      10.25  123.00$       11.74      140.88$      13.00    156.00$          
Kangaroo Pocket 12   8.00 96.00$        11.20    134.40$      -      -$                5.00     60.00$        6.35    76.20$         5.94        71.28$        7.00      84.00$            
XX Large 3     2.00 6.00$          2.00      6.00$          1.50    4.50$              2.50     7.50$          2.00    6.00$           4.00        12.00$        5.00      15.00$            
XXX Large 3     2.00 6.00$          2.00      6.00$          1.50    4.50$              2.50     7.50$          3.00    9.00$           4.00        12.00$        5.00      15.00$            
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        24.00  24.00$            60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         30.00      30.00$        -        -$                
First Color 12   0.50 6.00$          1.00      12.00$        1.75    21.00$            25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         2.28        27.36$        2.50      30.00$            
Second Color 12   0.50 6.00$          0.25      3.00$          0.75    9.00$              25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         0.96        11.52$        1.00      12.00$            
First Color 12   0.50 6.00$          1.00      12.00$        1.75    21.00$            25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         2.28        27.36$        2.50      30.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 239.88$      324.00$      196.80$          1,287.00$   260.20$       332.40$      342.00$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 19.99$        27.00$        16.40$            107.25$      21.68$         27.70$        28.50$            

Full Zipper Sweatshirt F280 38   22.00 836.00$      26.35    1,001.30$   21.50  817.00$          20.00   760.00$      21.62  821.56$       27.44      1,042.72$   29.00    1,102.00$       
XX Large 5     2.00 10.00$        2.00      10.00$        1.50    7.50$              2.50     12.50$        2.00    10.00$         4.00        20.00$        5.00      25.00$            
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        -      -$                60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         20.00      20.00$        -        -$                
First Color 38   0.50 19.00$        1.00      38.00$        1.10    41.80$            25.00   950.00$      0.75    28.50$         1.98        75.24$        2.00      76.00$            
Second Color 38   0.50 19.00$        0.25      9.50$          0.50    19.00$            25.00   950.00$      0.75    28.50$         0.71        26.98$        0.75      28.50$            
ORDER TOTAL 884.00$      1,073.80$   885.30$          2,732.50$   898.56$       1,184.94$   1,231.50$       
AVG COST/SHIRT 23.26$        28.26$        23.30$            71.91$        23.65$         31.18$        32.41$            

Sweatshirt 7.75 oz 224 6.45 1,444.80$   8.95      2,004.80$   7.30    1,635.20$       13.80   3,091.20$   7.35    1,646.40$    6.31        1,413.44$   8.25      1,848.00$       
XX Large 6     2.00 12.00$        2.00      12.00$        1.50    9.00$              2.50     15.00$        2.00    12.00$         4.00        24.00$        5.00      30.00$            
XXX Large 4     2.00 8.00$          2.00      8.00$          1.50    6.00$              2.50     10.00$        3.00    12.00$         4.00        16.00$        5.00      20.00$            
Youth 200 0.00 -$            -        -$            1.00    200.00$          (0.85)   (170.00)$     (0.50)   (100.00)$      1.95        390.00$      -        -$                
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        -      -$                60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         20.00      20.00$        -        -$                
First Color 224 0.50 112.00$      1.00      224.00$      1.00    224.00$          25.00   5,600.00$   0.69    154.56$       1.47        329.28$      1.75      392.00$          
First Color 224 0.50 112.00$      1.00      224.00$      1.00    224.00$          25.00   5,600.00$   0.69    154.56$       1.47        329.28$      1.75      392.00$          
ORDER TOTAL 1,688.80$   2,487.80$   2,298.20$       14,206.20$ 1,889.52$    2,522.00$   2,682.00$       
AVG COST/SHIRT 7.54$          11.11$        10.26$            63.42$        8.44$           11.26$        11.97$            

2,812.68$   3,885.60$   3,380.30$       18,225.70$ 3,048.28$    4,039.34$   4,255.50$       

ITEM 3: Safety Clothing
Safety Green T-Shirt 5.6 oz 12   3.85 46.20$        4.20      50.40$        3.10    37.20$            28.00   336.00$      4.46    53.52$         5.00        60.00$        5.05      60.60$            
XX Large 3     1.25 3.75$          2.00      6.00$          1.50    4.50$              5.00     15.00$        2.00    6.00$           1.90        5.70$          2.50      7.50$              
XXX Large 3     3.00 9.00$          2.00      6.00$          1.50    4.50$              5.00     15.00$        3.00    9.00$           1.90        5.70$          2.50      7.50$              
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        24.00  24.00$            60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         30.00      30.00$        -        -$                
First Color 12   0.50 6.00$          1.00      12.00$        1.75    21.00$            25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         2.28        27.36$        2.50      30.00$            
Second Color 12   0.50 6.00$          0.25      3.00$          0.75    9.00$              25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         0.96        11.52$        1.00      12.00$            
First Color 12   0.50 6.00$          1.00      12.00$        1.75    21.00$            25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         2.28        27.36$        2.50      30.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 76.95$        104.40$      121.20$          1,326.00$   114.52$       167.64$      147.60$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 6.41$          8.70$          10.10$            110.50$      9.54$           13.97$        12.30$            

Safety Green ANSI T-Shirt 38   11.99 455.62$      12.60    478.80$      15.40  585.20$          26.00   988.00$      15.03  571.14$       19.01      722.38$      20.00    760.00$          
XX Large 2     1.25 2.50$          2.00      4.00$          1.75    3.50$              5.00     10.00$        2.00    4.00$           1.90        3.80$          2.50      5.00$              
XXX Large 2     3.00 6.00$          2.00      4.00$          1.75    3.50$              5.00     10.00$        3.00    6.00$           1.90        3.80$          2.50      5.00$              
XXXX Large 1     4.00 4.00$          3.00      3.00$          1.50    1.50$              6.00     6.00$          4.00    4.00$           2.25        2.25$          3.75      3.75$              
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        -      -$                60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         10.00      10.00$        -        -$                
First Color 38   0.50 19.00$        1.00      38.00$        1.10    41.80$            25.00   950.00$      0.75    28.50$         1.98        75.24$        2.00      76.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 487.12$      542.80$      635.50$          2,024.00$   623.64$       817.47$      849.75$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 12.82$        14.28$        16.72$            53.26$        16.41$         21.51$        22.36$            

Safety Grn Sweatshirt 9.3 oz 224 8.45 1,892.80$   11.25    2,520.00$   9.30    2,083.20$       12.00   2,688.00$   9.26    2,074.24$    9.28        2,078.72$   10.25    2,296.00$       
XX Large 15   1.25 18.75$        2.00      30.00$        1.75    26.25$            5.00     75.00$        2.00    30.00$         1.90        28.50$        2.50      37.50$            
XXX Large 19   3.00 57.00$        2.00      38.00$        1.75    33.25$            5.00     95.00$        3.00    57.00$         1.90        36.10$        2.50      47.50$            
XXXX Large 5     4.00 20.00$        3.00      15.00$        1.50    7.50$              6.00     30.00$        4.00    20.00$         2.25        11.25$        3.75      18.75$            
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        -      -$                60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         20.00      20.00$        -        -$                
First Color 224 0.50 112.00$      1.00      224.00$      1.00    224.00$          25.00   5,600.00$   0.69    154.56$       1.47        329.28$      1.75      392.00$          
First Color 224 0.50 112.00$      1.00      224.00$      1.00    224.00$          25.00   5,600.00$   0.69    154.56$       1.47        329.28$      1.75      392.00$          
ORDER TOTAL 2,212.55$   3,066.00$   2,598.20$       14,148.00$ 2,500.36$    2,833.13$   3,183.75$       
AVG COST/SHIRT 9.88$          13.69$        11.60$            63.16$        11.16$         12.65$        14.21$            

Safety Grn ANSI S-shirt 9.3 oz 12   26.99 323.88$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.00   252.00$      34.30  411.60$       38.10      457.20$      37.00    444.00$          
XX Large 2     2.00 4.00$          5.00     10.00$        2.00    4.00$           1.90        3.80$          2.50      5.00$              
XXX Large 2     3.00 6.00$          5.00     10.00$        3.00    6.00$           1.90        3.80$          2.50      5.00$              
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         2.00        2.00$          -        -$                
First Color 12   0.50 6.00$          25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         2.28        27.36$        2.00      24.00$            
First Color 12   0.50 6.00$          25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         2.28        27.36$        2.00      24.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 345.88$      932.00$      455.60$       521.52$      502.00$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 28.82$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 77.67$        37.97$         43.46$        41.83$            

3,122.50$   3,713.20$   3,354.90$       18,430.00$ 3,694.12$    4,339.76$   4,683.10$       
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ITEM 4: Moisture Wicking Shirts
T-Shirts 36   6.49 233.64$      12.60    453.60$      10.75  387.00$          15.50   558.00$      10.34  372.24$       6.04        217.44$      7.00      252.00$          
XX Large 3     2.00 6.00$          2.00      6.00$          1.00    3.00$              2.70     8.10$          3.00    9.00$           3.00        9.00$          2.00      6.00$              
XXX Large 3     3.00 9.00$          2.00      6.00$          2.00    6.00$              2.70     8.10$          4.00    12.00$         3.00        9.00$          2.00      6.00$              
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 36   2.40 86.40$        2.80      100.80$      1.80    64.80$            4.40     158.40$      4.60    165.60$       3.72        133.92$      3.20      115.20$          
ORDER TOTAL 335.04$      614.40$      476.80$          832.60$      570.84$       417.36$      387.20$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 9.31$          17.07$        13.24$            23.13$        15.86$         11.59$        10.76$            

Men's Shirts 75   12.99 974.25$      15.40    1,155.00$   13.00  975.00$          14.00   1,050.00$   12.64  948.00$       15.07      1,130.25$   18.00    1,350.00$       
Women's Shirts 25   11.99 299.75$      15.40    385.00$      13.00  325.00$          14.00   350.00$      12.64  316.00$       15.07      376.75$      18.00    450.00$          
XX Large 15   2.00 30.00$        2.00      30.00$        2.00    30.00$            2.70     40.50$        3.00    45.00$         3.00        45.00$        2.00      30.00$            
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 100 2.40 240.00$      2.80      280.00$      1.40    140.00$          4.40     440.00$      4.60    460.00$       2.80        280.00$      2.60      260.00$          
ORDER TOTAL 1,544.00$   1,898.00$   1,486.00$       1,980.50$   1,781.00$    1,880.00$   2,098.00$       
AVG COST/SHIRT 20.59$        25.31$        19.81$            26.41$        23.75$         25.07$        27.97$            

1,879.04$   2,512.40$   1,962.80$       2,813.10$   2,351.84$    2,297.36$   2,485.20$       

ITEM 5: Sports, Polo Style for Screen Printing
Men's Shirts 5     8.65 43.25$        7.30      36.50$        6.25    31.25$            9.00     45.00$        5.76    28.80$         5.10        25.50$        12.00    60.00$            
Women's Shirts 7     8.65 60.55$        7.30      51.10$        6.25    43.75$            9.00     63.00$        5.76    40.32$         7.21        50.47$        12.00    84.00$            
XX & XXX Large 3     1.50 4.50$          2.00      6.00$          2.00    6.00$              5.00     15.00$        2.00    6.00$           4.75        14.25$        2.50      7.50$              
Pocket 12   2.00 24.00$        -        -$            -      -$                4.50     54.00$        2.00    24.00$         3.90        46.80$        2.00      24.00$            
Set Up 1     0.00 -$            15.00    15.00$        12.00  12.00$            60.00   60.00$        10.00  10.00$         10.00      10.00$        -        -$                
First Color 12   0.50 6.00$          1.00      12.00$        1.75    21.00$            25.00   300.00$      1.00    12.00$         1.47        17.64$        2.50      30.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 138.30$      120.60$      114.00$          537.00$      121.12$       164.66$      205.50$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 11.53$        10.05$        9.50$              44.75$        10.09$         13.72$        17.13$            

ITEM 6: Sport Shirt, Pique Polo Style 
Men's Shirts 18   9.45 170.10$      14.70    264.60$      8.85    159.30$          10.00   180.00$      8.61    154.98$       11.04      198.72$      14.00    252.00$          
Women's Shirts 15   9.45 141.75$      14.70    220.50$      8.50    127.50$          10.00   150.00$      8.61    129.15$       11.04      165.60$      14.00    210.00$          
XX Large 3     1.50 4.50$          2.00      6.00$          1.00    3.00$              4.50     13.50$        2.00    6.00$           4.60        13.80$        3.00      9.00$              
XXX Large 3     3.00 9.00$          2.00      6.00$          2.00    6.00$              4.50     13.50$        3.00    9.00$           4.60        13.80$        3.00      9.00$              
XXXX Large 1     4.00 4.00$          3.00      3.00$          3.00    3.00$              5.00     5.00$          4.00    4.00$           6.00        6.00$          4.00      4.00$              
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 33   2.40 79.20$        2.80      92.40$        2.00    66.00$            4.40     145.20$      4.60    151.80$       3.72        122.76$      3.20      105.60$          
ORDER TOTAL 408.55$      640.50$      380.80$          607.20$      466.93$       568.68$      597.60$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 12.38$        19.41$        11.54$            18.40$        14.15$         17.23$        18.11$            

ITEM 7: Twill Shirts
Men's Shirts Short Sleeve 5     15.50 77.50$        17.50    87.50$        14.50  72.50$            10.00   50.00$        12.64  63.20$         17.91      89.55$        20.00    100.00$          
Women's Shirts S/S 7     15.50 108.50$      17.50    122.50$      14.50  101.50$          10.00   70.00$        12.64  88.48$         17.91      125.37$      50.00    350.00$          
XX Large 1     2.00 2.00$          2.00      2.00$          2.00    2.00$              6.00     6.00$          2.00    2.00$           4.60        4.60$          3.00      3.00$              
XXX Large 1     3.00 3.00$          3.00      3.00$          2.00    2.00$              5.00     5.00$          3.00    3.00$           4.60        4.60$          3.00      3.00$              
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 12   2.40 28.80$        2.80      33.60$        2.00    24.00$            4.40     52.80$        4.60    55.20$         4.40        52.80$        4.00      48.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 219.80$      296.60$      218.00$          283.80$      223.88$       324.92$      512.00$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 18.32$        24.72$        18.17$            23.65$        18.66$         27.08$        42.67$            

Men's Shirts Long Sleeve 18   14.95 269.10$      17.50    315.00$      14.50  261.00$          11.00   198.00$      12.64  227.52$       16.04      288.72$      17.50    315.00$          
Women's Shirts L/S 15   14.95 224.25$      17.50    262.50$      14.50  217.50$          11.00   165.00$      12.64  189.60$       16.04      240.60$      17.50    262.50$          
XXX Large 5     3.00 15.00$        3.00      15.00$        2.00    10.00$            6.00     30.00$        3.00    15.00$         4.60        23.00$        3.00      15.00$            
XXXX Large 1     4.00 4.00$          5.00      5.00$          5.00    5.00$              5.00     5.00$          4.00    4.00$           6.95        6.95$          4.00      4.00$              
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 33   2.40 79.20$        2.80      92.40$        1.80    59.40$            4.40     145.20$      4.60    151.80$       3.72        122.76$      3.20      105.60$          
ORDER TOTAL 591.55$      737.90$      568.90$          643.20$      599.92$       730.03$      710.10$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 17.93$        22.36$        17.24$            19.49$        18.18$         22.12$        21.52$            

811.35$      1,034.50$   786.90$          927.00$      823.80$       1,054.95$   1,222.10$       

ITEM 8: Heavy Twill and Denim Shirts
Men's Shirts 6.5 oz S/S 5     15.75 78.75$        18.50    92.50$        14.00  70.00$            14.00   70.00$        14.95  74.75$         18.69      93.45$        21.00    105.00$          
Women's Shirts 7     15.75 110.25$      18.50    129.50$      14.00  98.00$            16.00   112.00$      14.95  104.65$       18.69      130.83$      21.00    147.00$          
XX Large 3     1.50 4.50$          2.00      6.00$          2.00    6.00$              6.00     18.00$        2.00    6.00$           5.00        15.00$        3.00      9.00$              
XXX Large 3     4.00 12.00$        4.00      12.00$        2.00    6.00$              6.00     18.00$        3.00    9.00$           5.00        15.00$        4.00      12.00$            
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 12   2.40 28.80$        2.80      33.60$        2.00    24.00$            4.40     52.80$        4.60    55.20$         4.40        52.80$        4.00      48.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 234.30$      321.60$      220.00$          370.80$      261.60$       355.08$      329.00$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 19.53$        26.80$        18.33$            30.90$        21.80$         29.59$        27.42$            

Men's Shirts 7.0 oz L/S 18   13.65 245.70$      17.35    312.30$      12.50  225.00$          14.00   252.00$      14.95  269.10$       15.91      286.38$      17.00    306.00$          
Women's Shirts 15   13.65 204.75$      17.35    260.25$      21.50  322.50$          14.00   210.00$      14.95  224.25$       15.91      238.65$      17.00    255.00$          
XXX Large 5     4.00 20.00$        4.00      20.00$        2.00    10.00$            6.00     30.00$        3.00    15.00$         5.00        25.00$        3.00      15.00$            
XXXX Large 1     5.00 5.00$          5.00      5.00$          4.00    4.00$              5.00     5.00$          4.00    4.00$           7.00        7.00$          4.00      4.00$              
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 33   2.40 79.20$        2.80      92.40$        1.80    59.40$            4.40     145.20$      4.60    151.80$       3.72        122.76$      3.20      105.60$          
ORDER TOTAL 554.65$      737.95$      636.90$          742.20$      676.15$       727.79$      693.60$          
AVG COST/SHIRT 16.81$        22.36$        19.30$            22.49$        20.49$         22.05$        21.02$            

788.95$      1,059.55$   856.90$          1,113.00$   937.75$       1,082.87$   1,022.60$       

ITEM 9: Caps & Hats
PDT 600 6-Panel Structured Hat 12   3.00 36.00$        3.75      45.00$        3.30    39.60$            9.00     108.00$      5.34    64.08$         4.44        53.28$        8.00      96.00$            
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 12   2.40 28.80$        2.80      33.60$        2.00    24.00$            4.40     52.80$        4.60    55.20$         4.40        52.80$        4.00      48.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 64.80$        126.60$      79.60$            260.80$      131.28$       154.08$      152.00$          
AVG COST/HAT 5.40$          10.55$        6.63$              21.73$        10.94$         12.84$        12.67$            

KN 550 Jersey Knit Safety Orang  50   3.50 175.00$      4.50      225.00$      4.10    205.00$          17.00   850.00$      5.80    290.00$       4.14        207.00$      4.00      200.00$          
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 50   2.40 120.00$      2.80      140.00$      1.40    70.00$            4.40     220.00$      4.60    230.00$       2.80        140.00$      2.60      130.00$          
ORDER TOTAL 295.00$      413.00$      291.00$          1,170.00$   532.00$       395.00$      338.00$          
AVG COST/HAT 5.90$          8.26$          5.82$              23.40$        10.64$         7.90$          6.76$              

359.80$      539.60$      370.60$          1,430.80$   663.28$       549.08$      490.00$          
ITEM 10: Fleece Jackets
Fleece Jacket 18   14.60 262.80$      18.50    333.00$      16.50  297.00$          50.00   900.00$      12.94  232.92$       17.48      314.64$      19.00    342.00$          
XX Large 2     1.50 3.00$          2.00      4.00$          2.00    4.00$              12.00   24.00$        2.00    4.00$           3.00        6.00$          2.50      5.00$              
XXX Large 2     3.00 6.00$          3.00      6.00$          2.00    4.00$              12.00   24.00$        3.00    6.00$           3.00        6.00$          2.50      5.00$              
Digitizing Fee 1     0.00 -$            48.00    48.00$        16.00  16.00$            100.00 100.00$      12.00  12.00$         48.00      48.00$        8.00      8.00$              
Embroidery Fee 18   2.40 43.20$        2.80      50.40$        2.00    36.00$            4.40     79.20$        4.60    82.80$         4.40        79.20$        4.00      72.00$            
ORDER TOTAL 315.00$      441.40$      357.00$          1,127.20$   337.72$       453.84$      432.00$          
AVG COST/JACKET 17.50$        24.52$        19.83$            62.62$        18.76$         25.21$        24.00$            

GRAND TOTAL 11,727.07$    15,499.75$       12,926.20$         58,882.24$      13,711.06$      16,298.86$        17,437.80$          
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