CITY OF SPRINGFIELD MO

SOLICITATION #119-2010 RFQ

OPENED: May 13, 2010/ 3:00 PM

VENDOR Summa * Calumet Photgraphic * 17th Street Photo * Camera Boutique (Alt) *
DELIVERY 14 Days ARO * 21 Days ARO * 5 Days ARO * 28 Days ARO *
TERMS Net 30 * Net 30 * None * 1% 15, Net 30 *
EXCEPTIONS None * None * Yes * None *
* * * *
QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * LOW ITEM
* * * *
1 Camera, Powershot A480 30 92.23 2766.90 * 96.99 2909.70 * 95.00 2850.00 * 95.20 2856.00 * 2766.90
2 Case, 1120 Guard Box 30 23.73 711.90 * 20.14 604.20 * 25.00 750.00 * 28.35 850.50 * 604.20
3 Battery Charger Kit 30 12.23 366.90 * 12.39 371.70 * 15.00 450.00 * 14.95 44850 * 366.90
4 Digital Memory Card 150 7.49 1123.50 * 8.52 1278.00 * 7.95 1192.50 * 7.67 1150.50 * 1123.50
BID ALL YES OR NO YES * YES * YES * YES *
LOW TOTAL 4969.20 * 5163.60 * 5242.50 * 5305.50 * 4861.50
LOW OVERALL 4969.20 * 5163.60 * 5242.50 * 5305.50 * #REF!
VENDOR Focus Camera * B& H Photo - Video * Soft Net Solutions  * W. Schiller & Co. *
DELIVERY 9 Days ARO * 10 Days ARO * 15 Days ARO * 10 Days ARO *
TERMS Net 30 * Net 30 * Net 30 * Net 30 *
EXCEPTIONS None * None * Yes * Yes *
* * * *
QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * LOW ITEM
* * * *
1 Camera, Powershot A480 30 93.06 2791.80 * 99.90 2997.00 * 99.00 2970.00 * 99.00 2970.00 * 2791.80
2 Case, 1120 Guard Box 30 23.18 695.40 * 19.99 599.70 * 24.00 720.00 * 25.00 750.00 * 599.70
3 Battery Charger Kit 30 11.30 339.00 * 16.50 495.00 * 19.95 598.50 * 15.00 450.00 * 339.00
4 Digital Memory Card 150 9.94 1491.00 * 8.49 1273.50 * 7.99 1198.50 * 9.50 1425.00 * 1198.50



BID ALL YES OR NO
LOW TOTAL
LOW OVERALL

YES*
5317.20 *
5317.20 *

YES *
5365.20 *
5365.20 *

YES *
5487.00 *
5487.00 *

YES*
5595.00 *
5595.00 *

4929.00
#REF!

DISCLAIMER: THIS BID TABULATION INDICATES ONLY THE BIDS AS RECEIVED. ALL BIDS ARE SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION FOR ACCURACY, AND FOR SPECIFICATION AND
CONTRACT COMPLIANCE. NO CONCLUSIONS ABOUT CONTRACT AWARDS SHOULD BE DRAWN FROM THESE PRELIMINARY TABULATIONS.

VENDOR Camera Boutique * HPI International *  OM Office Supply Inc * Unique Photo *
DELIVERY 28 Days ARO * 7 Days ARO * 10 Days ARO * 14 Days ARO *
TERMS 1% 15, Net 30 * Net 30 * Net 30 * None *
EXCEPTIONS None * None * None * Yes *
* " * *
QTY UNITPRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * LOW ITEM
* * " *
1 Camera, Powershot A480 30 105.63 3168.90 * 109.00 3270.00 * 103.00 3090.00 * 107.50 3225.00 * 3090.00
2 Case, 1120 Guard Box 30 28.35 850.50 * 24.79 743.70 * 25.00 750.00 * 24.95 748.50 * 743.70
3 Battery Charger Kit 30 14.95 448.50 * 23.60 708.00 * 20.00 600.00 * 9.75 292.50 * 292.50
4 Digital Memory Card 150 7.67 1150.50 * 6.10 915.00 * 10.75 1612.50 * 11.95 1792.50 * 915.00
BID ALL YES OR NO YES * YES * YES * YES *
LOW TOTAL 5618.40 * 5636.70 * 6052.50 * 6058.50 * 5041.20
LOW OVERALL 5618.40 * 5636.70 * 6052.50 * 6058.50 * #REF!
VENDOR Modern Imaging Sol * CDW-G * Adorama Camera * Mwave *
DELIVERY 14 Days ARO * 10 Days ARO * 3 Days ARO * 20 Days ARO *
TERMS None * None * Net 30 * Net 30 *
EXCEPTIONS None * None * None * Yes *
* " * *
QTY UNITPRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * LOW ITEM

*

*

*

*



1 Camera, Powershot A480 30 98.00 2940.00 * 105.00 3150.00 * 119.00 3570.00 * 124.00 3720.00 * 2940.00
2 Case, 1120 Guard Box 30 26.00 780.00 * 35.00 1050.00 * 21.79 653.70 * 35.00 1050.00 * 653.70
3 Battery Charger Kit 30 26.50 795.00 * 12.00 360.00 * 17.99 539.70 * 21.00 630.00 * 360.00
4 Digital Memory Card 150 12.00 1800.00 * 12.00 1800.00 * 11.95 1792.50 * 7.99 1198.50 * 1198.50
BID ALL YES OR NO YES * YES * YES * YES *

LOW TOTAL 6315.00 * 6360.00 * 6555.90 * 6598.50 * 5152.20
LOW OVERALL 6315.00 * 6360.00 * 6555.90 * 6598.50 * #REF!

DISCLAIMER: THIS BID TABULATION INDICATES ONLY THE BIDS AS RECEIVED. ALL BIDS ARE SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION FOR ACCURACY, AND FOR SPECIFICATION AND
CONTRACT COMPLIANCE. NO CONCLUSIONS ABOUT CONTRACT AWARDS SHOULD BE DRAWN FROM THESE PRELIMINARY TABULATIONS.

VENDOR VSA, Inc * Bedford Camera & Video * Grainger * Lawrence Photo *
DELIVERY 30 Days ARO * 10 Days ARO * 3 Days ARO * 10 Days ARO *
TERMS Net 30 * None * None * None *
EXCEPTIONS None * Yes * None * None *
* " " *
QTY * UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * LOW ITEM
* " * *
1 Camera, Powershot A480 30 123.20 3696.00 * 99.99 2999.70 * 132.05 3961.50 * 129.99 3899.70 * 2999.70
2 Case, 1120 Guard Box 30 21.86 655.80 * 39.99 1199.70 * 23.19 695.70 * 38.95 1168.50 * 655.80
3 Battery Charger Kit 30 13.77 413.10 * 33.99 1019.70 * 29.68 890.40 * 34.95 1048.50 * 413.10
4 Digital Memory Card 150 13.20 1980.00 * 9.19 1378.50 * 10.31 1546.50 * 12.97 1945.50 * 1378.50
BID ALL YES OR NO YES * YES * YES * YES *
LOW TOTAL 6744.90 * 6597.60 * 7094.10 * 8062.20 * 5447.10
LOW OVERALL 6744.90 * 6597.60 * 7094.10 * 8062.20 * #REF!

VENDOR Aprisa Technology * Media Specialists * Electronics Supply Co * Platt Luggage *



DELIVERY 30 Days ARO *

14 Days ARO *

14 Days ARO *

15 Days ARO *

TERMS Net 30 * Net 30 * Net 30 * Net 30 *
EXCEPTIONS None * None * None * None *
* * * *
QTY  UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION* UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * LOW ITEM
* * * *
1 Camera, Powershot A480 30 118.00 3540.00 * 116.00 3480.00 * No Bid 0.00 * No Bid 0.00 * 0.00
2 Case, 1120 Guard Box 30 28.88 866.40 * 21.95 658.50 * 30.25 907.50 * 28.89 866.70 * 658.50
3 Battery Charger Kit 30 14.88 446.40 * No Bid 0.00 * No Bid 0.00 * No Bid 0.00 * 0.00
4 Digital Memory Card 150 18.88 2832.00 * 11.90 1785.00 * No Bid 0.00 * No Bid 0.00 * 0.00
BID ALL YES OR NO YES * YES * YES * YES *
LOW TOTAL 7684.80 * 5923.50 * 907.50 * 866.70 * 658.50
LOW OVERALL 7684.80 * 5923.50 * 907.50 * 866.70 * #REF!

DISCLAIMER: THIS BID TABULATION INDICATES ONLY THE BIDS AS RECEIVED. ALL BIDS ARE SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION FOR ACCURACY, AND FOR SPECIFICATION AND

CONTRACT COMPLIANCE. NO CONCLUSIONS ABOUT CONTRACT AWARDS SHOULD BE DRAWN FROM THESE PRELIMINARY TABULATIONS.
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