
CITY OF SPRINGFIELD MO
Invitation for Bid #150-2010
Open 7-1-10

VENDOR Gordon Feed SoMo Hostetler1 * Hostetler2 * Premium *
DELIVERY 3-14 days 3-14 days * 3-14 days * 10 days *
TERMS 2%7 N30 N30 N30 * N30 * N30 *
EXCEPTIONS no yes yes * yes * yes *

QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * LOW ITEM

1 Cracked Corn 200 5.80 1160.00 7.15 1430.00 4.95 990.00 * 6.68 1336.00 * no bid no bid * 1160.00 Hostetler1
2 Sweet Feed, Grain with    44 5.70 250.80 8.75 385.00 6.12 269.28 * 6.12 269.28 * no bid no bid * 250.80 Gordon Feed
3 Egg Pellets 3 7.20 21.60 8.20 24.60 7.94 23.82 * 7.94 23.82 * no bid no bid * 21.60 Gordon Feed
4 Equine Athlete, Purina o  80 25.75 2060.00 no bid no bid 28.11 2248.80 * 28.11 2248.80 * no bid no bid * 2060.00 Gordon Feed
5 Equine Senior, Purina or 12 13.95 167.40 12.55 150.60 14.25 171.00 * 15.28 183.36 * no bid no bid * 167.40 SoMo
6 Equine Food 75 19.95 1496.25 29.43 2207.25 9.25 693.75 * 9.25 693.75 * no bid no bid * 693.75 Hostetler2
7 Dog Food, Red flannel 30 23.75 712.50 27.70 831.00 21.50 645.00 * 25.65 769.50 * no bid no bid * 712.50 Hostetler1
8 Dog Food, Bil-Jac 50 38.88 1944.00 no bid no bid 32.02 1601.00 * 32.02 1601.00 * no bid no bid * 1601.00 Hostetler2
9 Dog food J/D 2 43.58 87.16 no bid no bid 47.99 95.98 * 47.99 95.98 * no bid no bid * 87.16 Gordon Feed
10 Dog food lamb 8 42.76 342.08 no bid no bid 34.06 272.48 * 34.06 272.48 * no bid no bid * 272.48 Hostetler2
11 Kangaroo/Wallaby 100 25.50 2550.00 no bid no bid 27.83 2783.00 * 27.83 2783.00 * no bid no bid * 2550.00 Gordon Feed
12 Flamingo Complete 25 59.02 1475.50 no bid no bid 66.15 1653.75 * 66.15 1653.75 * no bid no bid * 1475.50 Gordon Feed
13 Flamingo breeder 8 68.77 550.16 no bid no bid 77.42 619.36 * 77.42 619.36 * no bid no bid * 550.16 Gordon Feed
14 Waterfowl maintenance 70 27.65 1935.50 no bid no bid 30.19 2113.30 * 30.19 2113.30 * no bid no bid * 1935.50 Gordon Feed
15 Waterfowl breeder 1 30.75 30.75 no bid no bid 32.82 32.82 * 32.82 32.82 * no bid no bid * 30.75 Gordon Feed
13a Guniea pig diet 6 11.67 70.02 no bid no bid 12.19 73.14 * 12.19 73.14 * 11.09 66.54 * 66.54 Premium
14a Rabbit Pellets 24 9.70 232.80 9.85 236.40 10.89 261.36 * 10.89 261.36 * 10.00 240.00 * 232.80 Gordon Feed
15a Chinchilla diet 3 12.75 38.25 no bid no bid 13.12 39.36 * 13.12 39.36 * 12.80 38.40 * 38.25 Gordon Feed
16 Parrot Maintenance 15 26.15 392.25 no bid no bid 27.89 418.35 * 27.89 418.35 * 22.53 337.95 * 337.95 Premium
17 Parrot Breeder diet 1 26.15 26.15 no bid no bid 27.89 27.89 * 27.89 27.89 * 32.50 32.50 * 26.15 Gordon Feed
18 Small Bird Maintenance 4 26.15 104.60 no bid no bid 27.89 111.56 * 27.89 111.56 * 22.53 90.12 * 90.12 Premium
19 Crane diet 5 27.37 136.85 no bid no bid 29.22 146.10 * 29.22 146.10 * no bid no bid * 136.85 Gordon Feed
20 Softbill diet 10 32.76 327.60 no bid no bid 34.98 349.80 * 34.98 349.80 * 19.17 191.70 * 191.70 Premium
21 Tortoise diet 12 21.85 262.20 no bid no bid 23.33 279.96 * 23.33 279.96 * no bid no bid * 262.20 Gordon Feed
22 Freshwater turtle 1 35.56 35.56 no bid no bid 37.75 37.75 * 37.75 37.75 * no bid no bid * 35.56 Gordon Feed
23 Feline Small 12 31.28 375.36 no bid no bid 33.40 400.80 * 33.40 400.80 * no bid no bid * 375.36 Gordon Feed
24 New World Primate 35 30.92 1082.20 no bid no bid 33.40 1169.00 * 33.40 1169.00 * 17.41 609.35 * 609.35 Premium
25 Leaf-eater Gorilla Size 80 17.63 1410.40 no bid no bid 18.84 1507.20 * 18.84 1507.20 * no bid no bid * 1410.40 Gordon Feed
26 Zebra Pellets 80 21.72 1737.60 no bid no bid 23.53 1882.40 * 23.53 1882.40 * no bid no bid * 1737.60 Gordon Feed
27 Omnivore diet 25 26.56 664.00 no bid no bid 28.36 709.00 * 28.36 709.00 * 12.40 310.00 * 310.00 Premium
28 Elephant suppliment 32 20.62 659.84 no bid no bid 22.02 704.64 * 22.02 704.64 * no bid no bid * 659.84 Gordon Feed
29 ADF #25 800 10.96 8768.00 no bid no bid 11.71 9368.00 * 11.71 9368.00 * no bid no bid * 8768.00 Gordon Feed
30 Ratite diet 110 18.25 2007.50 no bid no bid 19.93 2192.30 * 19.93 2192.30 * no bid no bid * 2007.50 Gordon Feed
31 Ratite breeder diet 15 18.15 272.25 no bid no bid 19.47 292.05 * 19.47 292.05 * no bid no bid * 272.25 Gordon Feed
32 Wild herbivore diet 900 16.96 15264.00 no bid no bid 18.87 16983.00 * 18.87 16983.00 * no bid no bid * 15264.00 Gordon Feed
33 Cricket diet 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid * no bid no bid * no bid no bid * 0.00 Gordon Feed
34 Scratch grain 1 6.95 6.95 7.98 7.98 7.35 7.35 * 8.04 8.04 * no bid no bid * 6.95 Gordon Feed
35 Horse pellets 25 7.95 198.75 15.15 378.75 10.15 253.75 * 12.08 302.00 * no bid no bid * 198.75 Gordon Feed
36 Sheep Pellets 26 7.75 201.50 8.80 228.80 8.00 208.00 * 21.47 558.22 * no bid no bid * 201.50 Gordon Feed
37 Sheep mineral 4 17.85 71.40 17.90 71.60 19.50 78.00 * 23.63 94.52 * no bid no bid * 71.40 Gordon Feed
38 Goat ration 26 8.45 219.70 8.60 223.60 7.88 204.88 * 8.94 232.44 * no bid no bid * 219.70 Gordon Feed
39 Chicken layer diet 52 7.75 403.00 12.30 639.60 7.99 415.48 * 7.99 415.48 * no bid no bid * 403.00 Gordon Feed
40 Turkey diet 26 10.40 270.40 14.85 386.10 11.52 299.52 * 11.52 299.52 * no bid no bid * 270.40 Gordon Feed
41 Duck & Goos diet 22 10.40 228.80 12.95 284.90 11.52 253.44 * 11.52 253.44 * no bid no bid * 228.80 Gordon Feed
42 Hog Grower 100 7.90 790.00 9.65 965.00 8.51 851.00 * 8.51 851.00 * no bid no bid * 790.00 Gordon Feed
43 Cat food 20# 18 17.67 318.06 21.75 391.50 21.73 391.14 * 21.73 391.14 * no bid no bid * 318.06 Gordon Feed
44 Cotton seed hulls 28 7.25 203.00 7.65 214.20 7.50 210.00 * 7.50 210.00 * no bid no bid * 203.00 Gordon Feed
45 Salt Block, 50# 4 4.50 18.00 5.95 23.80 5.50 22.00 * 5.50 22.00 * no bid no bid * 18.00 Gordon Feed
46 Salt Block, 4# 12 5.50 66.00 6.90 82.80 6.80 81.60 * 6.80 81.60 * no bid no bid * 66.00 Gordon Feed
47 Salt Block, 50#, min 1 2.00 2.00 2.45 2.45 2.35 2.35 * 2.35 2.35 * no bid no bid * 2.00 Gordon Feed
48 Salt Block, 4#, min 12 2.00 24.00 2.50 30.00 2.35 28.20 * 2.35 28.20 * no bid no bid * 24.00 Gordon Feed



49 Lilck Tub 60# 20 30.50 610.00 33.35 667.00 32.12 642.40 * 32.12 642.40 * no bid no bid * 610.00 Gordon Feed
50 Lilck Tub 60# 2 78.90 157.80 98.95 197.90 85.38 170.76 * 85.38 170.76 * no bid no bid * 157.80 Gordon Feed
----- ------------ ------------------ ------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ * ------------------ ----------------------- * ------------------ ------------------ * ------------------ ---------------------------

---------------------------------------- Yes No Yes * Yes * No *
BID ALL YES OR NO 52,440.49 10,060.83 55,286.87 * 56,212.97 * 1,916.56 *
LOW TOTAL 52,440.49 NO TOTAL 55,286.87 * 56,212.97 * NO TOTAL * 52440.49 Gordon Feed
LOW OVERALL

`
             CONTRACT COMPLIANCE.  NO CONCLUSIONS ABOUT CONTRACT AWARDS SHOULD BE DRAWN FROM THESE PRELIMINARY TABULATIONS.






	TEMPLET3

