City of Sprinafield MO

SOLICITATION #028-2011 IFB

OPENED: September 22, 2010

VENDOR Scan Technoloay * Turn-Key Mobile * OM Office Supply * IKON Office Solutions  * SC-ID, LLC * Peak Technologies. Inc. * En Pointe Technologies *
DELIVERY 5 Davs ARO * 14 Davs ARO * 20 Davs ARO * 5-7 Davs ARO * 7-10 Davs ARO * 56 Davs * 10-14 Davs ARO *
TERMS Net 30 * N/A * Net 30 * Net 10 * .5% 20 Davs. Net 30 * N/A * Net 30 *
EXCEPTIONS None * None * None * Yes * None * S * None *
OTYUNIT PRICE EXTENSION *UNIT PRICE EXTENSION *UNIT PRICE EXTENSION *UNIT PRICE EXTENSION *UNIT PRICE EXTENSION *UNIT PRICE EXTENSION *UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * LOW ITEM
1 E-Seek M-250 & CN6000 140 396.00 55440.00 * 438.00 61320.00 * No Bid 0.00 * No Bid 0.00 * 474.72 66460.80 * No Bid 0.00 * No Bid 0.00 * 0.00 OM Office Supplv
2 GPS Receiver 140 No Bid 0.00 * 78.00 10920.00 * 330.00 46200.00 * No Bid 0.00 * No Bid 0.00 * No Bid 0.00 * No Bid .00 * 0.00 Scan Technoloav
3 Zebra RW420 & Cradle 140 808.00 113120.00 * 704.00 98560.00 * 838.00 117320.00 * 816.24 114273.60 * 710.72 99500.80 * 782.50 109550.00 * 816.84 114357.60 * 98560.00 Turn-Kev Mobile
BID ALL YES OR NO YES * YES * YES * YES * YES * YES * YES *
LOW TOTAL 168560.00 * 170800.00 * 163520.00 * 114273.60 * 165961.60 * 109550.00 * 114357.60 * 0.00 LOW OVERALL
LOW OVERALL 168560.00 * 170800.00 * 163520.00 * 114273.60 * 165961.60 * 109550.00 * 114357.60 * 109550.00 Peak Technoloaies. Inc.

DISCLAIMER: THIS BID TABULATION INDICATES ONLY THE BIDS AS RECEIVED. ALL BIDS ARE SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION FOR ACCURACY, AND FOR SPECIFICATION AND
CONTRACT COMPLIANCE. NO CONCLUSIONS ABOUT CONTRACT AWARDS SHOULD BE DRAWN FROM THESE PRELIMINARY TABULATIONS.



	TEMPLET7

