
CITY OF SPRINGFIELD MO

SOLICITATION #070-2010 IFB

OPENED:  January 26, 2010 / 3:00 PM

VENDOR Coastal Energy * Vance Brothers *
DELIVERY 1 Day ARO * 1 Day ARO *

TERMS 1% 10, Net 30 * Net 30 *

EXCEPTIONS None * None *

* *

QTY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * UNIT PRICE EXTENSION * LOW ITEM

* *

1 Grade CRS-2P Modified Asphalt 50,000 2.05 102500.00 * 2.42 121000.00 * 102500.00 Coastal Energy

2 Grade CRS-2 Emulsified Asphalt 10,000 2.41 24100.00 * 2.12 21200.00 * 21200.00 Vance Brothers

3 Dust Buster III 3,000 1.35 4050.00 * No Bid No Bid * 4050.00 Coastal Energy

4 Pep Emulsion Prime Light 5,000 2.49 12450.00 * No Bid No Bid * 12450.00 Coastal Energy

5

6

7

8

9

BID ALL YES OR NO YES * No *

LOW TOTAL 143100.00 * 142200.00 * 140200.00 LOW OVERALL

LOW OVERALL 143100.00 * NO TOTAL *

DISCLAIMER:  THIS BID TABULATION INDICATES ONLY THE BIDS AS RECEIVED.  ALL BIDS ARE SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION FOR ACCURACY, AND FOR SPECIFICATION AND

CONTRACT COMPLIANCE. NO CONCLUSIONS ABOUT CONTRACT AWARDS SHOULD BE DRAWN FROM THESE PRELIMINARY TABULATIONS.
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